
 
Item # 

  
Description 

 
Quantity 

 
Unit 

Unit 
 Price 

Total  
Price 

 

Page 1 

 
 
 
 
 
 
1-1 

 
 

BEAUTY  SUPPLIES   BID 
 
 
 
 
BRUSHES,  Hair,  Diane #D8116 
No Substitutes 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
54 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
each 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
4.50 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

As Specified   Total Beauty  

 
 
  

 
1-2 

 
 

BRUSH, Vent,   
Bobby #100-AA  -No Substitutes 

 
    34 

 
each 

 
3.00 

 

  
BIDDING 
ON: 

 
 
As Specified 

  Total Beauty  

 
 
  

 
1-3 

 
 

 
BRUSH,   Professional  Stylist, 
Scalpmaster,  Burmax  #CS315-  NO 
SUBSTITUTES 
 

 
 
 
 
  59 

 
 
 
 
each 

 
 
 
 
.45 

 

  
BIDDING 
ON: 

 
 
As Specified 

  Burmax  

 
1-4  

 
BRUSH,  Purse size,  6” plastic bristles 
Scalpmaster  #1000  NO SUBSTITUTES 
 
 

 
 
 
  104 

 
 
 
each 

 
 
 
3.94 

 

  
BIDDING 
ON: 

 
 
As Specified 

  Burmax  

 
 
 
 



 
Item # 

  
Description 

 
Quantity 

 
Unit 

Unit 
 Price 

Total  
Price 

 

Page 2 

 
1-5  

 
SCALPMASTER,  Round Brush #1971 
NO SUBSTITUTES 
 

 
 
  57 

 
 
each 

 
 
.60 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

As Specified   Burmax  

 
 
1-6  

 
BRUSHES- Cricket  (Static Free) 
No Substitutes 
 
 
Fast Flo        5511832 
Tunnel          5511840 
RPM-XL      5511883 
RPM-12XL   511884 
RPM-SM      511882       
680                02680 

 
 
 
 
   17 
   17 
   17 
   17 
   17 
    2 

 
 
 
 
each 
each 
each 
each 
each 
each 

 
 
 
 
3.69 
3.69 
3.69 
3.69 
3.69 
3.69 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

 
As Specified 

  Total 
Beauty 

  

        
 
1-7  

 
COMB  & BRUSH CLEANER  BOX 
2 lb.  Ship Shape or equal 

 
  3 

 
each 

 
4.04 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

Ship Shape 
#33210 

  Burmax  

 
1-8  

 
COMBS, Fine, Coarse, Regular, 7” long 
Narrow, Krest #400   No Subsititutes 

 
   102 

 
Doz. 

 
4.50 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

 
C400/BLK 

  Total 
Beauty 

 

 
1-9  

 
COMBS, Krest #441 
No Substitute 

 
  7 

 
dozen 

 
 4.95 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

 
As Specified 

  Total Beauty  

 



 
Item # 

  
Description 

 
Quantity 

 
Unit 

Unit 
 Price 

Total  
Price 
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1-10  

 
COMBS, Afro Wide 
Ace #176 or equal 

 
 
 
30 

 
 
 
each 

 
 
 
.20 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

Burmax 
#789BD 

  Burmax  

 
 
1-11  COMBS,  Foil, Krest #4630  

  -0- 
 
each 

 
---------- 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

     

 
 
1-12  COMBS,  Pressing, Electric, Coarse, 

Small, Medium and Large 
 
  9 

 
each 

 
No Bids 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

   Purchase 
Open 
Market 

 

 
1-13  COMARE, Pick Comb #123-102 

No Substitutes 
 
    32 

 
each 

 
1.12 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

As Specified   Burmax  

 
1-14  CURLING IRON, Hot Tool, or equal 

   (Spring)    HTL 1103                  Size 1/2” 
                    HTL  1109                5/8” 
                    HTL   1138               3/8” 
                    HTL    1101              3/4” 
                    HTL    1181              1” 
                    HTL     1102            1 1/2" 
                    HTL     1111              2" 

 
27 
27 
27 
27 
27 
27 
27 

 
each 
each 
each 
each 
each 
each 
each 

 
18.00 
18.00 
18.00 
18.00 
20.00 
22.51 
25.51 

 
_________ 
_________ 
___________
___________ 
_________ 
__________ 
 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

 
Hot Tools 

  Burmax  

 



 
Item # 

  
Description 

 
Quantity 

 
Unit 

Unit 
 Price 

Total  
Price 
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1-15  ROUND CURLING BRUSH, 

Electric, Hot Tools,  #1141 
 
 
 
  6 

 
 
 
each 

 
 
 
33.95 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

As Specified   Total Beauty  

 
 
1-16  CURLING IRON, Zotos, Spring Handle 

½” Tip, Model #Z-210 
No Substitutes 

 
 
 
   28 

 
 
 
each 

 
 
No Bids 
Product 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

   Discontinued  

 
1-17  HAIR LIFTS, MINI, Plastic Top, Metal 

Teeth  Stylex or equal 
 
 
 
127 

 
 
 
each 

 
 
 
.13 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

Burmax HL-42   Burmax  

 
1-18  GOLD AND STRAIGHT HOT COMB 

Pressing Comb 
No Substitute 
 

 
 
 
   10 

 
 
 
each 

 
 
 
21.00 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

GH299   Burmax   

        
 
1-19  CERTIFIED TAIL COMB 

F4142, No Substitutes 
 
  279 

 
each 

 
No Award 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

   Open 
Market 
Purchase 

 

 
1-20  ISOPLUS, HOT CURLER-  #40505 

No Substitutes 
 
 18 

 
dozen 

 
45.60 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

 
As Specified 

  Total Beauty  

 



 
Item # 

  
Description 

 
Quantity 

 
Unit 

Unit 
 Price 

Total  
Price 
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1-21  CURLING IRON, Hot Tool, or equal 

   (No Spring)                      Size 1/2” 
                                                     5/8” 
                                                      3/8” 
                                                      1"               
                                                  1 1/2" 
                                                        2" 

 
 4 
 4 
 4 
 4 
 4 
 4 

 
each 
each 
each 
each 
each 
each 

 
20.00 
20.00 
20.00 
22.00 
24.51 
No Bid 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

Hot Tools   Burmax  

 
1-22  ELECTRIC FLAT IRON,  Babyliss, 

No Substitutes 
 
Small     1"   Babyliss BABP 2555 
Medium 
Large      2 1/2"   Babyliss  BABP 2559 

 
 
 
4 
2 
2 

 
 
 
each 
each 
each 

 
 
 
30.56 
No Bid 
30.56 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

 
As Specified 

  Burmax  

 
1-23  FLAT IRON,  Kizure,  #K-66, Large 

Beveled Flat Iron, 2 1/16",  No Substitutes 
 
  3 

 
each 

 
No Bids 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

   Open  
Market 
Purchase 

 

 
1-24  Pressing Comb by Kizure,  Sizes K-O for 

Temple,   No Substitutes 
 
 4 

 
each 

 
No Bids 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

   Open 
Market 
Purchase 

 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 
Item # 

  
Description 

 
Quantity 

 
Unit 

Unit 
 Price 

Total  
Price 
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2-1  PERMS, QUANTUM, 

All Types- Helene Curtis 
No Substitutes 
 

 
 
104 

 
 
each 

 
 
 
3.25 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

 
As Specified 

  Total Beauty  

 
2-2  PERMS, ONE & ONLY 

No Substitutes 
Shiny Silver-   #00-124 

 
 
163 

 
 
case 

 
 
68.00  case 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

As Specified- 
24 per case 

  Total Beauty  

 
2-3  PERMS, OUTER LIMITS-No Substitutes 

All Types- #24490 
 
 
62 

 
 
each 

 
 
4.10 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

 
As Specified 

  Total Beauty  

 
2-4  PERMS, ONE & ONLY  ACID 

No Substitutes 
#00-123 

 
 
65 

 
 
each 

 
 
2.90 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

As Specified   Total Beauty  

 
2-5   STERLIZING SOLUTIONS,  

1 Gallon, Bleniscide  No Substitutes             
 
 
 
  
 41 

 
 
 
 
gallon 

 
 
 
No Award 
Open 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

   Market 
Purchase 

 

 
2-6  CLIPPER BLADE, LUBRICANT 

CLEANER, Clippericide Spray, #72130 
 No Substitutes 

 
 
  75 

 
 
dozen 

 
 
50.40 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

  As Specified   Burmax  

 



 
Item # 

  
Description 

 
Quantity 

 
Unit 

Unit 
 Price 

Total  
Price 
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2-7  HAIR RELAXER, CRÈME OF 

NATURE, All Types, Jar,  15 oz. 
Regular  #24093, Mild # 24095,  
Super # 24097 
No Substitutes 

 
 
 
 
87 

 
 
 
 
each 

No Bids 
Open 
Market 
Purchase 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

     

 
2-8  HAIR STRAIGHTENER, Design Touch 

By Luster , 4 # Tub #53501 
No Substitutes 

 
 
 15 

 
 
each 

 
 
24.00 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

As Specified   Total Beauty  

 
2-9  CARE FREE CURL REARRANGER, 

Regular  #87912 ,  Max   # 87930 
Super    #87914 
 
No Substitute 

 
 
 
 
25 

 
 
 
 
each 

 
 
 
 
9.15 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

As Specified   Total Beauty  

 
 
2-10  CARE FREE CURL BOOSTER,  #87911 

No Substitutes 
 
 
 25 

 
 
each 

 
 
7.99 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

As Specified   Total Beauty  

 
 
2-11  CARE FREE, NEUTRALIZING 

SOLUTION,  #87909,  No Substitutes  
 16 oz. btl. 

 
 
     25 

 
 
each 

 
 
4.25 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

As Specified   Total Beauty  

 



 
Item # 

  
Description 

 
Quantity 

 
Unit 

Unit 
 Price 

Total  
Price 
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2-12  PAPERS, END, REGULAR, JUMBO 

 KING, 500/box, Rizia or equal              
Specify size when ordering 

 
 
 101 

 
 
box 

 
 
.95 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

Graham Tru Wave 1000 ct.   Total Beauty  

 
 
2-13 
 

 PERM RODS, Permanent Wave, White, 
Pink, Grey, Yellow, Red & Blue & Peach 
and Purple,  Diane or equal 
Specify size when ordering 

 
 
 
 508 

 
 
 
doz 

 
See List 
Prices are 
per  dozen 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

Soft N Style-Specify Color 
when ordering: 
 
White   .36 
Pink     .29 
Grey    .33 
Red     .25 
Blue    .27 
Peach  .48 

  Burmax  

 
2-14  GRAHAM CELLU DRI PERM COIL  OR 

EQUAL 
#44080 

 
  27 

 
box 

 
 
19.38 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

Graham Cellu Dri Perm Coil 
# 44080 

  Burmax  

 
 
2-15   WAVE NOUVEAU CONDITION COLD 

WAVE- No Substitutes 
 
PHASE I - Shape Release,   30 oz., #87778 
 
PHASE II- Shape Transformer, 16.9 oz. 
#87768 
 
PHASE III- Shape Lock,  16.9 oz.  #87762 

 
 
 
  5 
 
  8 
 
 
  8 

 
 
 
dozen 
 
dozen 
 
 
dozen 

 
 
 
219.40 
 
97.08 
 
 
73.20 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

 
As Specified 

  Total Beauty  

 
2-16  WAVE NOUVEAU,  

Finishing Moisture Lotion 16.9 oz. 
#87765-  No Substitutes 

 
 
  16 

 
 
dozen 

 
 
90.00 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

As Specified   Total Beauty  

 



 
Item # 

  
Description 

 
Quantity 

 
Unit 

Unit 
 Price 

Total  
Price 
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2-17  REVLON  SYNAPLEX  PERM  

PROCESS WITH I.C.C. 
No Substitutes 

 
 
 1 

 
 
each 

 
 
No Bids 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

   Open 
Market 
Purchase 

 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 
Item # 

  
Description 

 
Quantity 

 
Unit 

Unit 
 Price 

Total  
Price 
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3-1  CLAIROL  COLOR,  ALL  SHADES 

No Substitutes 
STATE SHADES WHEN ORDERING 

 
 
   94 

 
 
each 

 
 
2.81 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

Miss Clairol   Burmax  

 
 
3-2  SATIN CREAM HAIR COLOR, 3 oz. tube 

ALL SHADES  
No Substitutes 

 
 
 
   29 

 
 
 
tube 

 
 
 
4.25 

 
 
 
___________ 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

State Color when  
ordering 

  Burmax  

 
 
3-3  RINSE,  All Shades,  Roux  Fanci, 

Full or equal – State color when ordering. 
No Substitutes 

 
 
  25 

 
 
each 

 
 
7.15 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

 
As Specified 

  Total 
Beauty 

 

 
 
3-4  HYDROGEN  PEROXIDE, Clear 

 
 10 .    Volume 
20     Volume      Clairol 
30     Volume      Superstar 

 
 
    9 
   18 
   2 
 

 
 
gallon 
gallon 
gallon 

 
 
No Bid 
5.62 
8.10 

 
 
___________ 
_Burmax____
Total Beauty 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

Burmax bid on Clairol 
Total Beauty bid on Superstar

  TWO 
VENDORS 

 

 
 
3-5  

 
DYE  APPLICATOR  BRUSH, 
TOTO6 or equal 

 
 42 

 
each 

 
.22 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

 
Soft N Style  #666 

  Burmax  

 
 



 
Item # 

  
Description 

 
Quantity 

 
Unit 

Unit 
 Price 

Total  
Price 
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3-6  CLEAN  TOUCH,  TINT REMOVER, 

11.8 oz.  No Substitutes 
 
  51 

 
each 

 
5.95 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

 
As Specified 

  Total Beauty  

 
 
3-7  TINT  APPLICATOR  BOTTLE, 8 oz., 

Roux 
 
   65 

each  
.42 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

Burmax 
B14 

  Burmax  

 
 
3-8  CRÈME  OF  NATURE  HAIR COLOR 

NO SUBSTITUTES 
 
  76 

each  
No Bids 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

   Open 
Market 
Purchase 

 

 
3-9  DARK AND LOVELY HAIR 

COLORING 
NO SUBSTITUTES 

 
  26 

 
each 

 
No Bids 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

   Open 
Market 
Purchase 

 

       
 
3-10  BLEACH, 30 MINUTE. 

#1366202   
 
 4 

 
container 

 
12.50 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

As Specified   Total Beauty  

 
    
3-11  CLAIROL BLEACH, BW2, OFF SCALP 

NO SUBSTITUTES                    8  oz. 
                                                    32  oz. 

 
------- 
     1 

 
 
 
container 

 
6.00 
17.53 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

 
Clariol  #02578000 

  Burmax  

 



 
Item # 

  
Description 

 
Quantity 

 
Unit 

Unit 
 Price 

Total  
Price 
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3-12  FOIL               SBS  C TF-1350  Roll 

 
                        Ct-200-5     200 ct.  pop-up 

 
  
    4 

each 
 
each 

27.95 
 
10.99 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

 
Ct-500-5    500 ct. pop-up 

  Total Beauty  

 
 
3-13  UNRED  ADDITIVE FOR HAIR  

COLOR- To Prevent Unwanted Red Tone 
1 oz.,  AR4001 
No Substitutes 

 
 
 
    2 

 
 
 
each 

 
 
 
12.10 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

As Specified   Total Beauty  

 
3-14  GRAY DROPS, ADDITIVE,  1 oz. 

Add Color to Cover Gray Completely 
#AR4002 
No Substitutes 
 

 
 
 
 
  2 

 
 
 
 
each 

 
 
 
 
6.93 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

Gray Magic 
Ad780590 

  Burmax  

 
 
3-15  CLAIROL CREME PEROXIDE 

No Substitutes 
10  Volume 
20  Volume 
30  Volume 
40  Volume 

 
 
1 
4 
4 
4 

 
 
gallon 
gallon 
gallon 
gallon 

 
 
No Award 
8.45 
No Award 
No Award 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

Clairol   Burmax  

 
3-16  MOISTURE MAX  MOISTURIZING   

HAIR LOTION,  32 oz., No Substitutes 
 
  12 

 
each 

 
6.00 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

 
As Specified 

  Total Beauty  

 



 
Item # 

  
Description 

 
Quantity 

 
Unit 

Unit 
 Price 

Total  
Price 
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3-17  BASE CREME, SENSITIVE SCALP, 

BY SUMMIT,  No Substitutes, 
14 oz. Jar 

 
 
 
 
  4 

 
 
 
 
each 

No Bids 
Open 
Market 
Purchase 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

     

 
 
3-18  BANTU YELLOW OUT CONDITIONER,

No Substitutes 
8 oz. Bottle 

 
 
 
 
  12 

 
 
 
 
each 

 
 
 
 
4.00 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

As Specified   Total Beauty  

 
 
3-19  VOLUMAX VOLUMIZING ROOT 

LIFTER by Naturelle,  8.5 oz 
 
  6 

 
each 

 
5.70 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

 
As Specified 

  Total Beauty  

 
 
3-20  GENTLE TREATMENT NO-LYE 

CONDITIONING CREME RELAXER 
FOR GRAY HAIR  No Substitutes 

 
 
  12 

 
 
kit 

 
 
7.25 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

 
As Specified 

  Total 
Beauty 

 

 
 
3-21  LARGE TINT BRUSHES BY SALLY 

HAIRCOLOR 
 
  6 

 
each 

 
.29 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

 
SC1280 

  Burmax  

 
 
3-22  FUJI  END  PAPERS, 500 sheets/box 

No Substitutes 
 
 24 

 
box 

 
18.95 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

 
As Specified 

  Total Beauty  

 



 
Item # 

  
Description 

 
Quantity 

 
Unit 

Unit 
 Price 

Total  
Price 
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3-23  FUJI  PAPER HANDS FREE 

DISPENSER, No Substitutes 
 
  2 

 
each 

 
10.95 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

 
As Specified 

  Total Beauty  

 
 
3-24  CLAIROL JAZZING HAIR COLORS, 

Various Colors, 3 oz. bottle,  No 
Substitutes 

 
 
 24 

 
 
each 

 
 
2.99 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

Specify Color when ordering   Burmax  

 
3-25  MARCEL WAX  BY DAX, 12 oz. jar, 

No Substitutes 
 
  6 

 
each 

 
3.25 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

Dax Wax, 7.5 oz. Jar   Total Beauty  

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 
Item # 

  
Description 

 
Quantity 

 
Unit 

Unit 
 Price 

Total  
Price 
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4-1  HAIR SPRAY, VOLUMAX,  9 oz. 

#99282,  No Substitutese 
 
  24 

 
each 

 
6.00 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

 
As Specified 

  Total Beauty  

 
 
4-2  FRESH  HOLD SPRAY 

 
NO  SUBSTITUTES 

 
 
  24 

 
 
gallon 

 
No Bids 
Product 
Discontinued 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

     

 
4-3  QUANTUM  HAIR  SPRAY  12 oz. 

 
NO  SUBSTITUTES 

 
 
 32 

 
 
each 

 
 
No Bids 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

   Product 
Discontinued 

 

 
 
4-4  CLUBMAN  HAIR  SPRAY  FOR MEN, 

  
NO SUBSTITUTES 

 
 
  45 

 
 
each 

 
No Bids 
Product 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

   Discontinued  

 
 
 
4-5 

 CLUBMAN  STYLING  & GROOMING 
FOR  MEN  - Clubman, 8 oz., Non-
aerosol,  #274500 
 
 NO  SUBSTITUTES 

 
 
 
 
32 

 
 
 
each 

 
 
 
 
4.75 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

 
As Specified 

  Total Beauty  

 
 



 
Item # 

  
Description 

 
Quantity 

 
Unit 

Unit 
 Price 

Total  
Price 
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4-6  VIGORAL  MOUSSE,  9.25 oz. 

All Types, X-Body  #93040 
Relaxed #93044, Curls Super #93038 
Max Shine # 93092 
NO  SUBSTITUTES 

 
 
 
 
41 

 
 
 
 
each 

 
 
 
 
2.88 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

As Specified   Burmax  

 
 
4-7  GEL FOR BLACK HAIR 

Ampro,  32 oz.,  #01908 
 
33 

 
each 

 
4.25 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

As Specified   Total Beauty  

 
  
4-8  SPRAY  GEL,  Aura Flax Seed  

 
NO SUBSTITUTES 

 
 
25 

 
 
each 

 
 
No Bids 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

   Discontinued  

 
4-9  STYLING GEL,  Aura Flax Seed 

Styling Gel 
NO SUBSTITUTES 

 
 
31 

 
 
each 

 
 
No Bids 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

   Discontinued  

 
4-10  BAIN DE TERRE, Flax Seed Gel 

 
NO SUBSTITUTES 

 
 
32 

 
 
tub 

 
 
No Bids 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

   Discontinued  

 
4-11  LOTTA  BODY  SETTING  LOTION 

32 oz.,  #24010 , NO  SUBSTITUTES 
 
20 

 
each 

 
11.50 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

 
As Specified 

  Total Beauty  

 



 
Item # 

  
Description 

 
Quantity 

 
Unit 

Unit 
 Price 

Total  
Price 

 

Page 17 

 
4-12  ISOPLUS  OIL  SHEEN,  11 oz. 

#40563 
NO SUBSTITUTES 

 
 
70 

 
 
each 

 
 
4.80 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

As Specified   Total Beauty  

 
4-13  VOLUMAX  FREEZING  SPRAY,  

7 oz.,    #976181 
NO  SUBSTITUTES 
 

 
 
 
28 

 
 
 
each 

 
 
 
6.10 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

As Specified   Total Beauty  

 
4-14  TRESEMME 4+4 MOUSSE,  TM44 

13.5 oz.  No Substitutes 
 
NO  SUBSTITUTES 

 
 
 
  65 

 
 
 
each 

 
 
 
 5.45 

 

 BRAND As Specified    Total Beauty  
 
4-15  TRESEMME HAIR SPRAY,  TXH44 

4+4   X-TRA HOLD 
No Substitutes 

 
 
  62 

 
 
each 

 
 
5.45 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

As Specified   Total Beauty  

 
4-16  SCRUPLES PARFAIT MOUSSE 

8.5 oz. can 
NO SUBSTITUTES 

 
 
  74 

 
 
each 

 
 
7.50 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

 
As Specified 

  Total Beauty  

 
4-17  VAVOOM  FREEZING SPRAY BY 

MATRIX,  12 oz. bottle 
No Substitutes 

 
 
  20 

 
 
each 

No Bids 
Open 
Market 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

   Purchase  

 



 
Item # 

  
Description 

 
Quantity 

 
Unit 

Unit 
 Price 

Total  
Price 
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5-1  NAIL  POLISH,  CLEAR,  Orly  

TOTOR-01 
 
   5 

 
each 

 
4.50 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

 As Specified   Total Beauty  

 
 
5-2  ORLY  NAIL POLISH,  TOTOR-02 

All Shades 
 
 
  6 

 
 
each 

 
 
4.50 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

As Specified   Total Beauty  

 
5-3  NAIL  POLISH,  China Glaze 

All Shades 
 
 
  6 

 
 
each 

No Bids 
Open 
Market 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

   Purchase  

 
 
5-4  NAIL POLISH,  Out The Door, Clear,  

1/2 oz,   TOTOUT-1 
 
 
 6 

 
 
each 

 
 
3.95 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

As Specified   Total Beauty  

 
5-5  NAIL POLISH,  All Shades,  TOTOP1-1 

 
 

 
 
  8 

 
 
each 

 
 
3.50 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

Essie-Various Shades, 
Specify when ordering 

  Burmax  

 
5-6  POLISH  REMOVER,  Nail, Lensco, Non-

Acetone, 16 oz. 
 
NO  SUBSTITUTES 

  
 
 
 7 

 
 
 
pints 

 
 
 
4.00 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

 
As  Specified 

  Total Beauty  

 



 
Item # 

  
Description 

 
Quantity 

 
Unit 

Unit 
 Price 

Total  
Price 
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5-7  DIAMOND  DEB,  Nail File, 6/pkg. 

NO SUBSTITUTES 
 
  3 

 
pkg. 

No Bids 
Open 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

   Market 
Purchase 

 

 
5-8  NAIL  BUFFER 

4 in 1 Supershine, Super Nail 
#90680                            

 
 
  5   

 
 
each 

 
 
.68 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

Debra Lynn  DL-C117   Burmax  

 
5-9   NAIL FILES,  washable & sanitizable 

8/pkg 
Fine  240/400 Grit   
 
Medium  100/180  Grit 
Tropical Shine #707303 

 
 
  3 
 
 
   3 

 
 
pkg. 
 
pkg. 

 
 
2.16 
 
2.16 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

DL-35    8/pkg. 
DL-36     8/pkg 

  Burmax  

 
5-10  EYESHADOW  APPLICATORS 

Disposable,  Artist Choice, 36 ct. 
 

 
 
 -0- 

 
 
doz. 

 
 
--------- 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

     

 
5-11  HAND CREAM, REVLON FORMULA 

4.5 Eighteen or Equal 
 

 
 
   2 

 
 
each 

 
 
2.50 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

Revlon Aquamarine 
14.8 oz. bottle 

  Total Beauty  

                                                                                                                                      
5-12  SPRAY  BOTTLES,  decorative, small 

8 oz.  or equal,  TOTO7 
 

  
 
  2 

 
 
each 

 
 
.89 

 

  BIDDING 
ON: 

Tolco 
Zebra/ Leopard 

  Burmax  

 



 
Item # 

  
Description 

 
Quantity 

 
Unit 

Unit 
 Price 

Total  
Price 
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5-13  SPRAY BOTTLES,  16 oz.  6 each .71  
 BIDDING 

ON: 
 
Debra Lynn B16 

  Burmax  

 
5-14  WOODEN SPATULA, TOTO8 or equal  

 
 
   1 

 
 
 
pk. 

 
 
 
.29 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

Fantasea,  #FSC243 
25 pr. pkg. 

  Burmax  

 
5-15  HAND CREAM,  QUEEN HELENA 

32 oz. 
  
 
 -0- 

 
 
each 

 
 
-------- 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

     

 
5-16  FACIAL CLEANSING  CREAM 

Hypoallergenic,  Ponds or approved equal 
4 oz. Jar 

 
 
  -0- 

 
 
each 

 
 
----------- 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

     

 
5-17  SPONGE  PIE  WEDGE, disposable for 

applying make-up                         50  ct. 
                                                     100 ct. 

 
  -0- 
  -0- 

 
dozen 
dozen 

 
---------__ 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

     

 
5-18  ORANGE STICKS,  Wood,  Pointed Tip   20 each .23  
 BIDDING 

ON: 
Debra Lynn,  DL-C75 
12 pr bag 

  Burmax  

 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 
Item # 

  
Description 

 
Quantity 

 
Unit 

Unit 
 Price 

Total  
Price 
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6-1  HAIR  DRYER 

Complete Standup Floor  Model 
Conditioner with wheels  #T0T002 

 
 
   1 

 
 
each 

 
 
90.00 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

Hot Tools, HTL #1059 
Tourmaline Ionic 

  Burmax  

 
6-2  WAHL TRIMMER UNIT, CORDLESS 

Rechargable #8900- No Substitutes 
 
 
  16 

 
 
each 

 
 
33.17 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

As Specified   Burmax  

 
6-3  WAHL TRIMMERS,  BLADES #1046 

(for above unit)-  No Substitutes 
 
 
 21 

 
 
each 

 
 
9.28 

 
 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

As Specified   Burmax  

 
6-4  OSTER FINISHER TRIMMER  

#76059030 
No Substitute 

 
 
  20 

 
 
each 

 
 
42.15 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

 
As Specified 

  Burmax  

 
6-5  CLIPPERS, OSTER, 

MODEL #111 
No Substitutes 

 
 
  28 

 
 
each 

 
 
133.83 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

 
As Specified 

  Burmax  

 
6-6  CLIPPER,  OSTER 

76 Lite- Titan 
No Substitutes 

 
 
 26 

 
 
each 

No Award 
Purchase 
Open 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

   Market  

 



 
Item # 

  
Description 

 
Quantity 

 
Unit 

Unit 
 Price 

Total  
Price 
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6-6A  BLADES FOR CLIPPER,  OSTER 

76 Lite- Titan 
 
                   Size   0000 
                   Size   000 
                   Size   1 
                   Size   1A 
                   Size   1  ½”  
                   Size    2” 
                   Size    3" 
                   Size    3  ½” 
 
No Substitutes 

 
 
  
  2 
  2 
  2 
  2 
  2 
  2 
  2 
  2 

 
 
 
each 
each 
each 
each 
each 
each 
each 
each 

 
 
 
 
 
No Award 
Open 
Market 
Purchase 
 
 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

     

 
6-7  REPLACEMENT BLADES FOR 

WAHL  Peanut #8685785 
No Substitutes 

 
 
  7 

 
 
each 

 
 
10.77 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

As Specified   Burmax  

 
  
6-8  BLADES,   for  above Clipper Oster#  111- 

No Substitutes 
                   Size   0000 
                   Size   000 
                   Size   1 
                   Size   1A 
                   Size   1  ½”  
                   Size    2” 
                   Size    3" 
                   Size    3  ½” 

 
 
   25 
   29 
   34 
   33 
   40 
   39 
   39 
   31 

 
 
each 
each 
each 
each 
each 
each 
each 
each 

 
 
20.25 
20.25 
20.25 
20.96 
23.86 
26.03 
No Bid 
27.48 

 
 
___________
___________
___________
___________
___________
___________
___________ 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

As Specified   Burmax  

 
6-9  OSTER UNIVERSAL GUARD FOR 

OSTER CLIPPER, No Substitutes 
 
 17 

 
each 

 
2.30 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

 
Specify Size 

  Burmax  

 



 
Item # 

  
Description 

 
Quantity 

 
Unit 

Unit 
 Price 

Total  
Price 
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6-10  CLIPPER, PEANUT, WAHL 

MODEL # 8685785, No Substitutes 
 
  12 

 
each 

 
32.55 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

As Specified   Burmax  

 
6-11  CLIPPER, ANDIS 

SKYLINE #2 TRIMMER MODEL  #1006 
No Substitutes 

 
 
  27 

 
 
each 

No Bids 
Open 
Market 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

   Purchase  

 
6-12.  ANDIS, REPLACEMENT BLADE SET 

MODEL # 1019,  No Substitutes 
 
 17 

 
each 

 
21.00 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

As Specified   Total Beauty  

 
6-13  HONEEWAX,  All  Purpose Honee,  

 14 oz. Jar,  refill, Gigi, #0330 
 

 
 
  9 

 
 
each 

 
 
8.56 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

As Specified   Burmax  

 
6-14  Dispenser for above (If Needed) 

Gigi Spacesaver #0892 
 
 
  5 

 
 
each 

 
 
20.51 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

As Specified   Burmax  

 
6-15  MAGNETIC  ROLLERS,  penny size 

dime size,  etc.   Blue ,  Aqua , Orange , Red , 
Yellow  & Beige     

 
  
 36 

 
 
dozen 

 
.56 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

Specify color when ordering   Burmax  

 
 



 
Item # 

  
Description 

 
Quantity 

 
Unit 

Unit 
 Price 

Total  
Price 
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6-16  ALMAR  CLIPS,  Dual purpose clips 

Marianna, 50/bx., 48 bxs/case 
 
   3 

 
dozen 

 
3.99 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

Marianna,  #10401 
80/box 

  Total Beauty  

 
6-17  ROLLER  CLIPS, , Marianna double prong 

clips,  80 ct. box,  #10462 
 

 
 
  10 

 
 
box 

 
 
2.80 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

Burmax 
#100 

  Burmax  

 
6-18  PIN CURL CLIPS,  Marianna single prong 

clips, 80ct. box  #10460 
 
 
  26 

 
 
box 

 
 
2.50 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

Soft N Style 
Single prong  80/box 

  Burmax  

 
 
6-19  VELCRO  ROLLERS,  Assorted Colors 

and Sizes 
 
Specify  Size When Ordering 

   22 dozen 1.12 
 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

Soft N Style  EZ10-EZ24 
Specify Size When Ordering 

  Burmax  

 
6-20  AIRLIFT CUTTING STOOL WITH 

WHEELS BY PIBBS,  #726,  
No Subsititutes 

 
 
  3 

 
 
each 

 
No  
Award 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

   Open 
Market 

 

 
6-21  BLACK  JET  BLOW  DRYER, HAND 

DRYER,  NO SUBSTITUTES 
 

 
 
   7 

 
 
each 

 
 
No Bids 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

   Open 
Market 
Purchase 

 

 



 
Item # 

  
Description 

 
Quantity 

 
Unit 

Unit 
 Price 

Total  
Price 
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6-22  BLOW  DRYER,  with diffuser , Zotos 

1700w/diffuser or equal 
 
  24 

 
each 

No Bids 
Product 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

   Discontinued  

 
6-23  BOBBY  PINS,  1lb.,  Brown, Black,  

Bronze, White & Silver,  
Marianna  1 lb box or equal 

 
 
 15  

 
 
box 

 
 
2.70 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

1 lb.,  Bronze or Black only 
P75 

  Burmax  

 
6-24  PINS,  Hair,  1 lbs./pkg.   

Black, Brown, Grey and White 
Marianna  # 10530,  1 lb. box, or equal 

 
 
 10 

 
 
box 

 
 
2.90 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

Black or Brown  1 lb. box 
P65 

  Burmax  

 
6-25  PINAUD,  TALC  CLUBMAN 

#23002 
 
  25 

 
each 

 
36.10 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

Sold By Case Only   case 
Burmax 

 

 
6-26  COTTON  CLOTH CAPE FOR 

HAIRCUTS  FOR  MEN 
 

 
 
 38 

 
 
each 

 
 
6.27 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

Scalpmaster 3017   Burmax  

 
6-27  TIMER,  60 minutes,  MANUAL 

Marianna Bell Square White  Timer 
 
  20 

 
each 

 
No Award 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

   Open 
Market 

 

 



 
Item # 

  
Description 

 
Quantity 

 
Unit 

Unit 
 Price 

Total  
Price 
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6-28  PLASTIC  CAPS,  with elastic bands 

Betty Dain  30/pkg., 
 

  
 
 81 

 
 
each 

 
 
1.08 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

Debran Lynn PC300   Burmax  

 
6-29  HAND  MIRRORS, Soft n Style, #11WH   22 each 1.26  
 BIDDING 

ON: 
 
As Specified 

  Burmax  

 
6-30  COATED  RUBBER BANDS,   Ponytail   153 pkg. .38  
 BIDDING 

ON: 
Gold Magic 12 per pkg.   Burmax  

 
6-31  HAIR  NETS,  FINE  MESH, Mirage or 

equal  
 
Black 
Silver 
Brown 
 

 
 
 
  51 
  61 
  51 

 
 
 
each 
each 
each 
 

 
 
 
.89 
.89 
.89 
 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

Product #146   Total Beauty  

 
6-32  ANTISEPTIC,  qt.  Seabreeze  ONLY 

NO  SUBSTITUTES 
#SB2000 

 
 
 
  6 

 
 
 
bottle 

 
 
 
7.89 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

32 oz. bottle, Seabreeze 
#SEP0402 

  Burmax  

 
6-33  BLOW  DRYER,  Attachment Jet Set 

Comb or equal 
 

 
 
  51 

 
 
each 

 
 
49.99 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

Babyliss Pro X-treme 
Bab2000 

  Total Beauty  

 



 
Item # 

  
Description 

 
Quantity 

 
Unit 

Unit 
 Price 

Total  
Price 
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6-34  CAPES,  Andre Dri-back , #116  or equal   43 dozen 72.36  
 BIDDING 

ON: 
 
Burmax  4018 

  Burmax  

  
 
6-35  CAPES,  Comb-Out  Fabric with 

velcro fasteners 
 
  4 

 
each 

 
1.98 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

Scalpmaster  #3020 
 

  Burmax  

 
 
6-36 

 CAPES,  Shampoo,  with velcro fasteners 
Betty Dain #311 or equal 

 
 110 

 
each 

 
2.58 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

 
Betty Dain #311 

  Burmax  

 
 
6-37  FLAT  TOP  GUIDE (FLATTOPER)  -0- each  ----------  
 BIDDING 

ON: 
     

 
 
6-38  RAIN HATS,  Diane Cover up #0984 

 
Assorted Colors 

 
 
  13 

 
 
doz. 

 
 
11.99 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

 
Diane D984 

  Total 
Beauty 

 

 
 
6-39  HYDROGEN PEROXIDE 

20 volume  32 oz. bottle 
 
 
  6 

 
 
btl. 

 
 
2.05 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

Clairol   Burmax  

 
6-40  BARBICIDE 

 
16 oz. bottle 

 
 
 
   52  

 
 
 
btl. 

 
 
 
3.45 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

As Specified 
 

  Burmax  

 



 
Item # 

  
Description 

 
Quantity 

 
Unit 

Unit 
 Price 

Total  
Price 
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6-41  GRAHAM CELLU  COTTON 

 
#44053 

 
 
  21 

 
 
box 

 
 
10.74 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

As Specified   Burmax  

 
6-42  GOLDEN HOT JUMBO CERAMIC 

HEATER STOVE,  GH51000,  No 
Substitutes 

 
  
   2 

 
 
each 

 
 
34.00 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

 
GH51000 

  Burmax  

 
6-43  HOT STOVE, Gold and Hot Complete 

Stove with  Irons,  GH5250 
No Substitutes 

 
   
  3 

 
 
each 

 
 
119.95 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

 
GH5250 

  Burmax  

 
6-44  CLASSIC ALL-PURPOSE HYDRAULIC 

SHAMPOO CHAIR BY PIBBS 
Reclines, Lifts, and Lowers for 
Shampooing & Styling 

 
 
 
  1 

 
 
 
each 

 
 
 
No Award 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

   Item Not  
Needed 

 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 
Item # 

  
Description 

 
Quantity 

 
Unit 

Unit 
 Price 

Total  
Price 
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7-1  SCISSORS,  6 ½,  Diane  #74 or equal 

No Substitutes 
 
 13 

 
pair 

 
65.00 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

 
As Specified 

  Total Beauty  

 
7-2  SHEARS,  Thinning, Stainless Steel, 

PIBBS, Diamond Ice 
 
 
NO  SUBSTITUTES 

 
 
 
 
 12 

 
 
 
 
pair 

 
 
 
 
4.35 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

As Specified   Burmax  

 
7-3  SWITCHBLADE  SHEARS,  4  ½”  

Feather,  #F1-05-145  No Substitutes 
 

 
 
 7 

 
 
each 

 
 
70.00 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

 
As Specified 

  Total  
Beauty 

 

 
7-4  BLADES,  for above,  #F1-10-145 

No Substitutes 
   
 17 

 
each 

 
15.95 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

As Specified   Total Beauty  

 
7-5  RAZOR,  Hair, Personna or equal 

 
 
 13 

 
each 

 
No Award 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

   Open 
Market 

 

 
7-6  BLADES,  Razor, 5/pkg./12 pkg./box 

Personna or equal 
 
 23 

 
each 

 
No Award 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

   Open 
Market 

 

 
 
 
 
 



 
Item # 

  
Description 

 
Quantity 

 
Unit 

Unit 
 Price 

Total  
Price 
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7-7  SCISSORS,  4 ½,  Diane #64 

 
NO SUBSTITUTES 
 

 
 
 
  23 

 
 
 
pair 

 
 
No Bids 
Open 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

   Market 
Purchase 

 

 
7-8  SCISSORS,  92#, 4”,  Diane Tempered 

No Finger Guard Stainless 
 
NO  SUBSTITUTES 
 

 
 
 
 
  27 

 
 
 
 
each 

 
 
 
No Bids 
Product 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

   Discontinued  

 
7-9  ROLLER CART WITH TRAYS 

SLIDING, 
Genie Kart, #KD2 

 
 
   4 

 
 
each 

 
 
61.40 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

Burmax 
#9007 

  Burmax  

 
7-10  STYLE LINER II ( ANDIS TRIMMER) 

#26700- No Substitutes 
 
  7 

each  
34.32 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

 
As Specified 

  Burmax  

 
7-11  RAZOR/COMB   2 each .64  
 BIDDING 

ON: 
Burmax Artistocract  
Razor/comb   RC12 

  Burmax  

 
7-12  SHEAR'S TEXTURIZING 15  Teeth  12 each No Award  
 BIDDING 

ON: 
   Open 

Market 
 

 
 
 



 
Item # 

  
Description 

 
Quantity 

 
Unit 

Unit 
 Price 

Total  
Price 
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7-13  OSTER BLADE, Model  #76913-706. 

Stainless Steel, Trimmer T-Blade, 1/125" 
(.2 mm cut)  Micro Close, No Substitutes 

 
 
  21 

 
 
each 

 
 
12.29 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

As Specified   Burmax  

 
7-14  CUTTING SCISSORS BY DIANE 5.5" 

#74, Stainless Steel,  No Substitutes 
 
 
   3 

 
 
each 

No Bids 
Open 
Market 
Purchase 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

     

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 
Item # 

  
Description 

 
Quantity 

 
Unit 

Unit 
 Price 

Total  
Price 
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8-1  SHAMPOO,  Neutralizer,  32 oz., Crème 

of Nature  Neutralizing,  #24099 
NO SUBSTITUTES 
 

 
 
 
 100 

 
 
 
bottle 

 
 
 
9.20 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

As Specified   Total 
Beauty 

 

 
8-2  SHAMPOO,  Moisturizing, 32 oz., Crème 

of  Nature,  #24057 
NO  SUBSTITUTES 

 
 
 212 

 
 
bottle 

No Bids 
Product 
Discontinued 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

     

 
8-3  SHAMPOO, 1 pt./btl.  Dandricide or 

equal 
 
 
NO  SUBSTITUTES 

 
 
 
 
 152 

 
 
 
 
bottle 

No Bids 
Open 
Market 
Purchase 
 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

     

 
8-4  SHAMPOO,  Nourishing,  

Image Maker for All Hair Types 
 
 
NO  SUBSTITUTES 

 
 
 
 
 100 

 
 
 
 
gallon 

 
No Bids 
Open 
Market 
Purchase 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

     

 
8-5  SHAMPOO,  SHIMMER  LIGHT 

16 oz./btl.,  #81519-01559 
 
 
 
NO  SUBSTITUTES 

 
 
 
 
 
 110 

 
 
 
 
 
each 

 
 
 
 
 
8.20 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

 
As Specified 

  Total 
Beauty 

 

 



 
Item # 

  
Description 

 
Quantity 

 
Unit 

Unit 
 Price 

Total  
Price 
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8-6  ALL   PURE-  Shampoo 

 
No Substitutes 
 

 
 
  
 30 

 
 
 
gallon 

 
No Bids 
Product 
Discontinued 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

     

 
8-7 
 

 SHAMPOO,  Waterless,  Rinse No More 
#71160,  16 oz.  or equal 
 

 
 
106 

 
 
each 

 
 
3.05 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

 
As Specified 

  Total Beauty  

 
8-8  COMFORT  RINSE FREE SHAMPOO 

CAP PRODUCT # 7909 (Sage)   
 
 50 

 
case 

No Bids 
Open 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

   Market  

 
8-9   STEPHAN’S  DANDRUFF REMOVER 

15 oz.  or equal,    R-0013 
NO  SUBSTITUTES 
 

 
 
 
 51 

 
 
 
each 

 
 
 
7.00 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

As Specified   Total  
Beauty 

 

 
8-10   CURL  REJUVENATOR  LOTION 

16 oz.,  Donnies or equal 
 

 
 
 50 

 
 
each 

No Bids 
Open 
Market 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

     

 
8-11 
 

 WONDER  8  OIL,  8 oz. 
#42020 
NO  SUBSTITUTES 

 
 
 
 29 

 
 
 
each 

 
 
 
5.05 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

 
As Specified 

  Total  
Beauty 

 

 



 
Item # 

  
Description 

 
Quantity 

 
Unit 

Unit 
 Price 

Total  
Price 
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8-12  AFRICAN  PRIDE  MIRACLE GRO 

HAIRDRESS, 5.3 oz.  jar,  #11550 
 
NO  SUBSTITUTES 

 
 
 
 213 

 
 
 
each 

 
 
 
5.20 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

 
As Specified 

  Total 
Beauty 

 

 
8-13  POROSITY  CONTROL,  Roux,   

#000110,  15 oz.  
No Substitutes 

 
 
 103 

 
 
each 

 
 
11.00 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

As Specified   Total Beauty  

 
8-14  CONDITIONER,  Cholesterol,  15 oz. jar 

Queen Helene # 653256 
No Substitutes  

 
 
 
54 

 
 
 
each 

 
 
 
2.35 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

 
As Specified 

  Burmax  

 
8-15  CONDITIONER,  Scalp & Hairdress 

6 oz., V05 
NO SUBSTITUTES 

 
 
 102 

 
 
jars 

No Bids 
Open 
Market 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

     

 
8-16  STYLING  MOUSSE,  10.5 oz.  DESIGN 

FREEDOM   X-tra  Firm 
NO  SUBSTITUTES 

 
 
 102 

 
 
each 

 
 
6.50 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

As Specified   Total 
Beauty 

 

 
8-17  MOUSSE,  LIQUID,  STYLING,  12 oz. 

Fantasia # 1885   or equal 
 

 
 
 100 

 
 
each 

 
 
6.99 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

As Specified   Total 
Beauty 

 

 



 
Item # 

  
Description 

 
Quantity 

 
Unit 

Unit 
 Price 

Total  
Price 
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8-18  

 
ROUX  FANCI-FUL  COLOR  STYLING 
MOUSSE,  6 oz.  #000412 , Assorted 
Colors or  equal 
 

 
 
 
 104 

 
 
 
each 

 
 
 
7.59 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

As Specified   Total Beauty  

 
8-19  

 
HAIR  FOOD,  TCB,  #91529,  10 oz., 
No Substitutes                         

 
 113 

 
each 

No Bids 
Product 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

   Discontinued  

 
8-20 
 

 ALL  WAYS  SUPER  GRO,  5.5 oz. 
#01628 
NO  SUBSTITUTES 

 
 
 72 

 
 
each 

 
 
4.70 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

 
As Specified 

  Total 
Beauty 

 

 
8-21 
 

 VITAFUSION  HAIR  TREATMENT 
16 oz.,   No Substitutes 
 

 
 
  79 

 
 
each 

No Bids 
Product 
Discontinued 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

     

 
8-22 
 

 PAUL MITCHELL SHAMPOO, #2, 
Gallon Size, No Substitutes 

 
 
  9 

 
 
gallon 

No Bids 
Open 
Market 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

     

 
8-23  STABILIZER  PLUS,  32 oz. bottle, 

#85025  French Perm Conditioner 
No Substitutes 

 
 
30 

 
 
each 

 
 
7.50 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

As Specified   Total Beauty  

 



 
Item # 

  
Description 

 
Quantity 

 
Unit 

Unit 
 Price 

Total  
Price 
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8-24  INSTANT  ACTIVATOR 

Conditioner  (Right On)  16 oz.,  #24032 
NO  SUBSTITUTES 

 
 
 
 200 

 
 
 
each 

 
 
 
6.00 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

As Specified   Total Beauty  

 
8-25  SCRUPLES,  Clarifying Hair  

Shampoo   12 oz. bottle 
NO SUBSTITUTES 

 
 
 126 

 
 
each 

 
 
5.60 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

 
As Specified 

  Total Beauty  

 
8-26  MANE  & TAIL  CONDITIONER 

12 oz.,   #89812 
NO  SUBSTITUTES 

 
 
 31 

 
 
each 

 
 
3.50 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

 
As Specified 

  Total 
Beauty 

 

                                                                       
8-27  MOTIONS, OIL RELAXER, 15 oz. 

#91284- No Substitutes 
 
LOTION OIL:  MOISTURIZER,  12 oz. 
#91824- No Substitutes 

 
23 
 
20 

 
each 
 
each 

 
6.10 
 
6.00 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

 
As Specified 

  Total 
Beauty 

 

 
8-28  PRO-LINE COMB-THRU, 10 oz. 

#82737, No Substitutes 
 
 
 27 

 
 
each 

 
 
2.50 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

 
As Specified 

  Total Beauty  

 
8-29  QUANTUM, PRE-PERM 

 SHAMPOO 3.38 OZ., No Substitutes 
 
  25 

 
each 

No Bids 
Product 

 

 BIDDING 
ON: 

   Discontinued  

 



 
Item # 

  
Description 

 
Quantity 

 
Unit 

Unit 
 Price 

Total  
Price 
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8-30  SANEK  NECK STRIP, #43310  

  
   4 

 
 
box 

 
 
7.65 

 

 BIDDING ON As Specified   Burmax  
 
8-31  SANEK DISPENSER FOR THE  

ABOVE,  #49356 
 
 
   2    

 
 
each 

 
 
11.95 

 

 BIDDING ON As Specified   Total Beauty  
 
 
8-32  WAX STRIPS FOR FACIAL WAX 

GIGI  100% cotton strips or approved 
equal 

 
  31 

 
pack 

 
4.86 

 

 BIDDING ON GiGi     GG-0610   Burmax  
 
-8-33  THIN WOODEN  WAX  STICKS FOR 

FACIAL WAX,  GIGI  
 
 

 
 
 
  100 

 
 
 
pack 

 
 
 
3.08 

 

 BIDDING ON GiGi    GG-0415   Burmax  
 
 
8-34  SURE CLEAN,  16 oz.,  #0750 

Gigi Surface Wax Cleaner 
No Substitutes 

 
 
  58 

 
 
each 

 
 
6.51 

 

 BIDDING ON As Specified   Burmax  
 
8-35  WAX  OFF,  Gigi Wax Off. 16 oz., #0885  

   56 
 
each 

 
6.51 

 

 BIDDING ON Gigi   #0885   Burmax  
 



 
Item # 

  
Description 

 
Quantity 

 
Unit 

Unit 
 Price 

Total  
Price 
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8-36  WAX COLLARS FOR WAX WARMER 

#0810,  50 ct., 14 oz. 
 
   10 

 
pack 

 
4.75 

 

 BIDDING ON GiGi   #0810   Burmax  
 
8-37  APRON FOR WORKING WITH  

CHEMICALS (MUST BE CLOTH),  
Chemical resistant, adjustable tie strips 

 
 
 3 

 
 
each 

No Award 
Open 
Market 

 

 BIDDING ON      
 
8-38  FLOWERY PROFESSIONAL EMERY 

BOARDS #1035p, 8/PKG  
 
 
   1  

 
 
pkg. 

 
No Award 
Item not 

 

 BIDDING ON    Needed  
 
8-39  FROSTING CAPS 

 
Conair Caps  12/box 

 
 
 1 

 
 
doz 

 
No Award 
Item Not 

 

 BIDDING ON    Needed  
 
8-40  QP GLAZE BY ELASTA SHINE 

8 oz. jar,  No Substitutes 
 
 12 

 
jar 

 
7.00 

 

 BIDDING ON As Specified   Total Beauty  
 
8-41  LE KAIR CHOLESTROL PLUS  

STRENGTHENING CONDITIONER  
16 oz. jar,   No Substitutes 

 
  
  8 

 
 
jar 

No Bids 
Open 
Market 

 

 BIDDING ON      
 
 



 
Item # 

  
Description 

 
Quantity 

 
Unit 

Unit 
 Price 

Total  
Price 
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