
SPECIAL DIET CONTRACT FOR OCTOBER

Description QTY Unit
MFG Name 
and Number SYSCO

PUREED SOUFFLES

1
Apple Cinnamon French Toast, Frozen, 4/4 lb. 
pans/case 3 case

Hormel 
1845429 54.46

or approved equal

2 Banana French Toast, Frozen, 4/4 lb pans/case 3 case
Hormel 
1845387 56.63

or approved equal Special Order

3 Beef BBQ Sauce, Cooked Frozen, 4/4 lb pans/case 2 case
Hormel 
2022077 63.78

or approved equal Special Order

4 Beef & Vegetables, Cooked, Frozen, 4/4 lb.pans/case 3 case Hormel 63.80
or approved equal 2012862 Special Order

5 Beef & Chili, Cooked, Frozen 4/4 lb. pans/case 0 case
Cliffdale 
Farms no bid

or approved equal

6 Beef Lasagna, Partly Baked, Frozen 4/4 lb.pans/cs 4 case
Hormel 
3334430 64.00

or approved equal Special Order
7 Cheese Pizza, Cooked, Frozen, 4/4 lb pans/case 1 case Hormel 65.20

or approved equal 1845445 Special Order

8 Chicken La Orange, Cooked, frozen, 4/4 lb. pans/case 3 case Hormel 65.20
or approved equal 2012888 Special Order

9 Peach French Toast, Frozen, 4/4 lb pans/case 3 case Hormel 54.76
or approved equal 1845395 Special Order

10
Roast Beef & Cheddar, Cooked, Frozen, 4/4 lb 
pans/case 4 case Hormel 63.78
or approved equal 1835586 Special Order

11 Tuna Cheddar, Cooked, Frozen 4/4 lb. pans/case 3 case Hormel 63.78
or approved equal 1832815 Special Order

12 Turkey Dinner, Cooked, Frozen 4/4 lb. pans/case 3 case Hormel 63.78
or approved equal 3334414 Special Order

PUREED MEATS, INDIVIDUAL SERVINGS, PRE-
FORMED

13
Baked Fish, Frozen, 3 oz. portion, 24/3 oz. 
servings/case 10 case

Hormel 
0928127 24.41

or approved equal



PUREED MEATS, INDIVIDUAL SERVINGS, PRE-
FORMED

Description QTY Unit
MFG Name 
and Number SYSCO

14
Beef Patty, Sirloiner, Frozen, 3 oz. portion 24/3 oz 
servings/case 13 case

Hormel 
0927533 24.56

or approved equal Special Order

15
Grillers, Hot Dogs, Frozen, 2 oz. portion, 24/2 oz. 
servings/case 11 case

Hormel 
8502353 20.16

or approved equal Special Order
16 Ham, Frozen, 3 oz. portion, 24/3 oz. servings/case 14 case Hormel 24.57

or approved equal O927814 Special Order

17 Roast Beef, Frozen 3 oz. portion, 24/3oz. Servings/case 18 case
Hormel 
0928143 24.41

or approved equal

18
Roast Chicken, Frozen, 3 oz. portion, 24/3 oz. 
servings/case 18 case

Hormel 
0927921 24.41

or approved equal

19 Roast Pork, Frozen, 3 oz. portion 24/3 oz. servings/case 14 case
Hormel 
0927939 24.57

or approved equal Special Order

20
Roast Turkey, Frozen, 3 oz. portion, 24/3 oz. 
servings/case 16 case

Hormel 
0927749 24.44

or approved equal

21
Sausage Patty, Frozen 1 oz. portion, 90/1 oz. 
serving/case 15 case

Hormel 
2458859 23.30

or approved equal Special Order

22 Country Bread, 3 oz. portion 24/3oz. Servings/case 0 case
Thick and 
Easy No bid

or approved equal

23 Turkey Dinner, 4 oz. portion 24/4 oz. servings/case 0 case
Thick and 
Easy No bid

or approved equal

24
Savory Beef & Vegetables, 4 oz. portion, 24/ 4oz. 
Servings/case 0 case

Thick and 
Easy No bid

or approved equal

25 Garden Vegetable Medley Lasagna 4 oz. 24/case 2 case
Thick and 
Easy No Award

or approved equal

26
Apple Cinnamon French Toast 3 oz. portion, 24/ 3 oz 
servings/case 0 case

Thick and 
Easy No bid

or approved equal

27
Breakfast Omelet, frozen, 2.5 oz.portion, 24/ 2.5 oz. 
servings/case 18 case

Hormel 
6060747 20.70

or approved equal Special Order

28
Breakfast Sausage Links, Frozen 2.5 oz. portion, 24/2.5 
oz servings/case 16 case

Hormel 
6060307 25.33

or approved equal Special Order



Description QTY Unit
MFG Name 
and Number SYSCO

29
Breakfast Waffle, Frozen, 2.5 oz portion, 24/2.5 oz 
servings/case 15 case

Hormel 
6060315 20.84

or approved equal Special Order


