
COOKIES AND CRACKERS
Description QTY Unit Unit Price Total Price Vendor

LANCE PRODUCTS OR APPROVED EQUAL:
1 Crackers, Saltines, 300/4 pk/case #159 case 14.17 Lance

2 Van-O-Lunch, 120/6 pkg/case #8 case 42.00 Lance
3 Choc-O-Lunch #5, 120/6 pk/case case 42.00 Lance
4 Oatmeal Creme Cookie, #414, 12/2 1/2 oz/box box 6.36 Lance
5 Malt Crackers, #10, 120/6 pk/case case 42.00 Lance
6 Toastchees, 120/6 pk/case #7 case 42.00 Lance
7 Lance Nip Cheese #12, 120/6 pks/case case 42.00 Lance
8 Crackers, Saltine, 500/2pk/cs. #34 case 12.66 Lance
9 Tom's Plain Potato Chips, 24/2.25 oz/cs #9400 case 18.00 Lance

10 Tom's BBQ Potato Chips, 25/2.25 oz/cs  #9399 case 18.00 Lance

11
Tom's Potato Chips, sour cream & onion, 48/ 7/8 
oz./case, #8743 case 15.36 Lance

12 Tom's Cheesepuffs, 42/1 oz/cs., #8163 case 13.44 Lance
13 White Cheddar Popcorn 60/3/4 oz/cs #227 case 15.00 Lance

14 Tom's BBQ corn chips, 50/ 1 3/8 oz pkg./case #8744 case 16.00 Lance
15 Peanuts, Salted, 100/1 1/8 oz/box  #88 case 27.00 Lance
16 Choc-o-Lunch Value Pack #9350, 24/2.75/box box 9.60 Lance
17 Van-o-Lunch Value Pack #9351, 24/2.75/box box 9.60 Lance
18 Pecan Pies, 12/3 oz/pies/box #328 box 8.16 Lance
19 Nut-o-Lunch 24 count #9353 2.75 oz/box box 9.60 Lance
20 Strawberry Cookies, 24/2.75 oz./bx. #9354 box 9.60 Lance

21 Salt & Vinegar Potato Chips, 48/7/8 oz/cs #01433 case 15.36 Lance
22 Salt & Vinegar Potato Chips, 25/2.25 oz  #9398 case 18.00 Lance
23 Tom's Hot Fries, 48/.875 oz/case #8780 case 15.36 Lance

HERRS OR APPROVED EQUAL
24 Saltine Crackers, 500 count, 2/pk case No Bid No Bid No Bid
25 Pretzel Rods, 336/bx-7 lb. 24 bxs/case,  #255 box 1.16 27.84 Herrs
26 Potato Chips, Regular, 84 ct/case #107 box 0.24 20.16 Herrs
27 Potato Chips, BBQ 84 ct./case  #108 box 0.24 20.16 Herrs
28 Potato Chips, Salt and Vinegar 84 pkg/cs  #106 box 0.24 20.16 Herrs



Description QTY Unit Unit Price Total Price Vendor
HERRS OR APPROVED EQUAL

29 Potato Chips, Sour Cream & Onion 84 pkg/cs #109 box 0.24 20.16 Herrs
30 Slim Jim Original, 24/box, #314 box No Bid No Bid No Bid
31 Pretzels, 84/pkg/cs  #615 box 0.24 20.16 Herrs
32 Pretzels, Circle H, 1 1/2 oz, 84/case  #241 case 0.24 20.16 Herrs
33 Cheese Curls, 1 oz., 42 ct/case #202 case 0.24 10.08 Herrs
34 White Cheddar Popcorn, 42 ct/case #211 case 0.24 10.08 Herrs
35 Regular Popcorn, 42 ct/case #210 case 0.24 10.08 Herrs
36 Potato Stix, 1 oz., 60/case  #280 box 0.24 14.40 Herrs
37 Corn Chips, Regular 1 1/2 oz., 42/case  #565 case 0.24 10.08 Herrs
38 Corn Chips, BBQ, 1 1/2 ounce, 42/case, #566 case 0.24 10.08 Herrs
39 Cheddar Fries 1 oz, 20/cs box 0.74 14.80 Herrs
40 Hot Fries, 1 oz., 20 ct. Code# 463 box 0.74 14.80 Herrs

41 Cheddar on Wheat, 1 1/2 oz/8 pkg./box  Code# 663 case 0.25 28.00 Herrs

42
Peanuts, Regular, Salted, 1 oz., 24/box Code#450 
Planters box No Bid No Bid No Bid

43 Almonds, 24/box, 1.5 oz. Smoked box No Bid No Bid No Bid
44 Pecan Fudge Brownies, 12/box/3 oz.  #465 each No Bid No Bid No Bid
45 Bacon Rinds, 44 ct., 1/2 oz, Code #286 each 0.22 9.68 Herrs

46 Van Krisp Kreem Fudge Wafer 8/pack, 24 ct/case box No Bid No Bid No Bid

47 Cheese Peanut Butter Crackers 8/14 pkg/cs. #660 case 0.25 28.00 Herrs

48 Toasty Peanut Butter Crackers, 8/14 pkg/cs. #661 case 0.25 28.00 Herrs
49 Cheese on Cheese Crackers #662 8/14 pkg/cs case 0.25 28.00 Herrs
50 Chips, Regular, 1/2 oz, 50 bags/cs  #101 case 4.90 Herrs
51 Chips Salt & Vinegar 1 oz., 84/case #106 case 0.24 20.16 Herrs
52 Chips, Regular 1 oz., 84 bgs/case #107 case 0.24 20.16 Herrs
53 Chips, BBQ, 1 oz., 84/case  #108 case 0.24 20.16 Herrs
54 Chips, Sour Cream & Onion 1 oz., 84/case #109 case 0.24 20.16 Herrs
55 Ragin Ranch, 1 oz., 84/case  #198 case 0.24 20.16 Herrs
56 Buffalo Wing Ripples, 1 oz., 84/case #770 case 0.24 20.16 Herrs
57 Chips, Regular, 2.75 oz, 24 ct/case  #120 case 0.74 17.76 Herrs
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58 Chips, BBQ, 2.75 oz, 24 ct./case #121 case 0.74 17.76 Herrs
59 Chips, Sour Cream & Onion, 2.75 oz, 24/cs #122 case 0.74 17.76 Herrs
60 Cheese Curls, 1.75 oz., 30/case, #203 case 0.74 17.76 Herrs
61 Popcorn, Regular  1 oz., 42/cs. #210 case 0.24 10.08 Herrs
62 Popcorn White Cheddar, .625 oz, 42/cs #271 case No Bid No Bid No Bid
63 Popcorn Carmel, 1.9 oz., 48 ct.  #152 case 0.47 22.56 Herrs
64 Hot Fries, 3.5 oz., 20/ct. #463 case 0.74 14.80 Herrs
65 Beef Jerky, 24 ct.,  #314 case No Bid No Bid No Bid
66 Cheyenne Red Hot Sausage, 36 ct.  #588 case 0.30 10.80 Herrs
67 Slim Jim Giant, 24 ct.  #315 box No Bid No Bid No Bid
68 Red Pistachios, 1.75 oz., 12 ct. #673 box No Bid No Bid No Bid
69 Cashews, Honey Roasted, 1.50 oz., 12ct.  #631 box No Bid No Bid No Bid
70 Nacho Tortilla Chips, 72/case #567 case No Bid No Bid No Bid
71 Bulk Tortilla, 8-6 oz, 2 lb. #593 case No Bid No Bid No Bid
72 Cheyenne Beef Stick, 100 ct., #538 box 0.18 18.00 Herrs
73 Snack Mix, 6 oz., 15/box, #637 box No Bid No Bid No Bid
74 Bite Size Hard Pretzel, 1.75 oz., 84 cts. #615 box 0.24 20.16 Herrs




