
 
 

  DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT UNIT 
PRICE 

TOTAL 
PRICE 

 
 
 
100 

 LANCE  INC 
 
 
CRACKERS,  SALTINES, 4/PKG./300 
CASE, 300/4 PK./CS.  
Lance Saltines  300/4 pk/cs.   #159 

 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
case 

 
 
 
 
 
9.54 

 

       
 
 
 
 

101  VAN-O- LUNCH,  6/pkg./ 120/6 pkg/cs. 
LANCE VAN-O-LUNCH  #8 

   
case 

 
30.72 

 

       
 

102  CHOC-O-LUNCH, 
LANCE CHOC-O-LUNCH   #5 

   
case 

 
30.72 

 

  120/6 pk/cs.     
 
 
 
  

103  LANCE  OATMEAL CRÈME,   
12/2 1/2 oz./box #414 
 

   
 
box 

 
 
4.21 

 

       
 
 
 
 

104  LANCE MALT CRACKERS,  
120/6 pk/cs/    #10 

   
case 

 
30.72 

 

       
 
 

105  TOASTCHEES, 
LANCE  TOASTCHEE,  120/6 pk/cs. 

   
case 

 
30.72 

 

      #7      
 
 

106  LANCE  CHEESE ON CHEESE 
120/6pk/cs. (Lance Nip Cheese) 

   
case 

 
30.72 

 

       #12      
 
 

107  CRACKERS,  SALTINES, 500 count, 
2 crackers, /pack.   LANCE SALTINES 
500/2pk/cs.     #34 

   
 
case 

 
 
10.71 

 

       
 
 

108  TOM'S  PLAIN POTATO CHIPS 
20/ 3 oz./case   #8740 

   
case 

 
9.84 

 

       
 



 

Item #  DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT UNIT 
PRICE 

TOTAL 
PRICE 

109  TOM'S  BBQ POTATO CHIP 
20/ 3 oz./case  #8742 

   
case 

 
9.84 

 

       
 
 

110  TOM'S POTATO CHIPS,  SOUR CREAM 
& ONION, 48/7/8oz./cs  #8743 
 

   
 
 
 
case 

 
 
 
 
9.84 

 

       
 

111  BEEF SNACKS,  ORIGINAL, 24/box 
LANCE BEEF SNACKS,  

   
box 

 
Discontinue 

 

      #0315      
 
 

112  TOM'S CHEESEPUFFS, 42/1 oz./cs. 
#8163  

   
case 

 
9.84 

 

            
 
 
 

113  LANCE WHITE CHEDDAR 
CHEESE POPCORN  60/3/4 oz./cs. 
#227 

   
 
 
case 

 
 
 
13.80 

 

       
 
 
 
 

114   TOM’S BBQ CORN CHIPS,  50/1 3/8  oz 
pkg./case #8744 

   
case 

 
10.25 

 

       
 
 

115  PEANUTS,  SALTED,  100/1  1 1/8 oz./bx   
#88 

   
case 

 
27.00 

 

       
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 
 
 

Item #  DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT UNIT 
PRICE 

TOTAL 
PRICE 

116  COOKIES,  CHOC-O-LUNCH, 
VAN-O-LUNCH Value Pack 24/2.75 /box  
 

   
 
 
box 

 
 
 
9.60 

 

 #9350-Choc #9351-Van     
 
 
 

117  PECAN  PIES,  12/3 oz/pies/box   box 5.83  
  #328      

 
 
 

118  NUT-O-LUNCH, 24 COUNT  
CONVENIENCE PACK,  
2.75 oz./bx  #9353 
 
 

   
 
 
 
box 

 
 
 
 
9.60 

 

     
 

  

 
 

119  STRAWBERRY  COOKIES 
24/2.75oz./bx.. (10cookies per tube) 

   
box 

 
9.60 

 

  #9354      
 
 
 
 
 

120  POTATO  CHIPS,  SALT/VINEGAR, 
48/7/8 oz./cs     #01433 
36 LANCE  SALT & VINEGAR   
20/ 3 OZ./cs.    #126 

  case 
 
 
case 

9.84 
 
 
16.25 

 

       
 
 
 
 
 

121  TOM'S  HOT FRIES 48/.875 oz./cs. 
#8780 

   
case 

 
9.84 

 

       
 
 



 
 
 
 

Item #  DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT UNIT 
PRICE 

TOTAL 
PRICE 

 
 
 
400 

 HERRS  POTATO CHIPS, INC. 
 
 
COOKIES,  BULK CHOCOLATE CHIP, 
BUTTER,  OATMEAL, COCONUT,  
260/box/6 boxes/cases 

 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
case 

 
 
 
 
 
 
No Bid 

 

       
 

401  COOKIES,  OATMEAL &  CHOCOLATE  
CHIP,  12/box Herr’s Code:    #421 
Chocolate Chip 
             #503  Oatmeal 
6/12- 2/pk 

  
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
case 

 
 
 
 
No Bid 

 

       
 

402  CRACKERS,  SALTINE,  500 COUNT 
2 crackers/pack 

   
case 

 
6.50 

 
6.50 

       
 

403  POTATO CHIPS, Regular, 3 lbs. 
Code #170 

   
Box 

 
No Bid 

 

       
 

404  POTATO CHIPS,  SLIGHTLY SALTED 
3 lb. 

   
box 

 
No Bid 

 

       
 

405  CORN CHIPS  4 lb.  Code #583      box No Bid  
       

 

406  POPCORN,  REGULAR,  1.5 lb. 
Code # 227 

   
box 

 
Discontinued 

 

       
 

407  CHEESE  CURLS,  2lbs.  #208   box Discontinued  
       

 

408  PRETZEL  RODS,  336/box- 7 lb. 
Code # 255- 24 boxes per case 

   
box 

 
1.16 

 
27.84 

       
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 
 
 
 

Item #  DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT UNIT 
PRICE 

TOTAL 
PRICE 

409  POTATO  CHIPS,  REGULAR 
84 ct/case   Code #107 

   
box 

 
.24 

 
20.16 

       
 
 
 
 

410  POTATO  CHIPS,  BBQ,  84 ct./case 
Code # 108 

   
box 

 
.24   

 
20.16 

       
 
 
   
 
    

411  POTATO  CHIPS, SALT/VINEGAR, 
84 pkg/case   Code# 106 

   
 
box 

 
 
.24 

 
 
20.16 

       
 

412  POTATO CHIPS,  SOUR CREAM &  
ONION,  84 pkg/case- Code # 109 

   
box 

 
.24 

 
20.16 

       
 
            
    

413  MEAT SNACKS,  SLIM JIMS, 
ORIGINAL,  24/box  
Code # 314 

   
 
box 

 
 
.74 

 
 
17.76 

       
 
 

414  PRETZELS,  HERRS,  84/pkg/case 
Code # 615 

   
case 

 
.24 

 
20.16 

       
 

415  PRETZELS,  HERRS  CIRCLE  H 
1  ½ oz.  84/case  Code #241 

   
case 

 
.24 

 
20.16 

       
 
 
 
 
 



 
 

Item #  DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT UNIT 
PRICE 

TOTAL 
PRICE 

416  CHEESE  CURLS,  1 ounce, 
42ct./case- Code # 202 

   
case  

 
 .24 

 
10.08 

       
 
 

417  POPCORN, White Cheddar 
42ct.  /case,   Code # 211   

   
case 

 
 .24 

 
10.08 

       
 
 

418  POPCORN,  REGULAR,   
42/case code #210  1/2 oz 

   
case 

 
 .24 

 
10.08 

       
 
 

419  POTATO  STIX,  1  ounce, 
60/ case,  Code #280 

   
box 

 
.24 

 
14.40 

       
 
 
 
    

420  CORN  CHIPS,  REGULAR,   1   ½ oz., 
42/case- Code # 565 

   
case 

 
.24 

 
10.08 

       
 
 

421  CORN CHIPS,  BBQ, 1 ½  ounce,  
42/case- Code # 566 

   
case 

 
.24 

 
10.08 

       
 
 

422  HERR'S CHEDDAR FRIES, 
1 oz., 42/case 

   
box 

 
.26 

 
10.92 

       
 
 

423  ANDY  CAP – HOT FRIES,  1 oz., 
72 ct- Code #602 

   
box 

 
.36 

 
25.92 

       
  
 

424  CHEDDAR ON WHEAT,  1 1/2 oz./ 
8 pkg./box   
 
Code # 663-14 boxs/cs 

   
 
 
case 

 
 
 
.25 

 
 
 
28.00 

       
 
 

425  PEANUTS,  REGULAR,  SALTED,  
1 oz.,  24/box,  Code #450  Planters 

   
box 

 
.25 

 
6.00 

       
 
 



 
 

Item #  DESCRIPTION 
 
 

QUANTITY UNIT UNIT 
PRICE 

TOTAL 
PRICE 

426  ALMONDS,  24/box/ 1.5 oz.  Smoked   box .62 14.88 
       

 

427  PECAN  FUDGE BROWNIES,  12/box/ 
3.0 ounce- code # 465 

   
box 

 
No Bid 

 

       
 

428  BACON  RINDS,  44 ct., 1/2 ounce 
Code # 286 

   
case 

 
.22 

 
9.68 

       
 
 
 
 

429  VAN KRISP KREEM FUDGE WAFER 
8/pak,  24 ct/case 

   
box 

 
No Bid 

 

       
 

430  CHEESE  PEANUT BUTTER 
CRACKERS, 8/14 pkg./cs. 
Code # 660 

   
 
case 

 
 
.25 

 
 
28.00 

       
 
 

431  TOASTY  PEANUT BUTTER 
CRACKERS, 8/14 pkg./cs 
Code # 661 

   
 
case 

 
 
.25 

 
 
28.00 

       
 

432  CHEESE ON CHEESE CRACKERS 
Code #662   8/14 pkg./cs 

   
case 

 
.25 

 
28.00 

       
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 
 
 

Item #  DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT UNIT 
PRICE 

TOTAL 
PRICE 

433  CHIPS,  REGULAR, ½ ounce,  50 
bags/case-  Code 101 

   
case 

 
 
.098 

 
 
4.90 

       
 
 

434  CHIPS,  SALT N’ VINEGAR,  1 ounce, 
84/case- Code # 106 

   
case 

 
.24 

 
20.16 

       
 
  

435  CHIPS,  REGULAR,  1 ounce,  84/case 
Code # 107 

   
case 

 
.24 

 
20.16 

       
 
 

436  CHIPS,  BBQ,  1 ounce,  84/case 
Code # 108  

   
case 

 
.24 

 
20.16 

       
 
 

437  CHIPS,  SOUR CREAM &  ONION, 
1 ounce,   84/case- Code #109 

   
case 

 
.24 

 
20.16 

       
 
 
 
 

438  RAGIN RANCH,   1 ounce,  84/case 
Code # 198 

   
case 

 
.24 

 
20.16 

       
 
 
   

 
439 

 BUFFALO WING RIPPLES, 1 oz.,  84 ct.  
Code # 770 

   
case 

 
.24 

 
20.16 

       
 
 

440  CHIPS,  REGULAR,  1. 5 oz.,  30 case- 
Code #117 

   
case 

 
Discontinued 

 

       
 
 

441  CHIPS,  BBQ,  1. 5 oz., 30/case,  
Code #118 

   
case 

 
Discontinued 

 

       
 
 
 
 



 
 

Item #  DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT UNIT 
PRICE 

TOTAL 
PRICE 

442  CHIPS,  SOUR CREAM & ONION, 
1. 5 oz., 30/case- Code # 119 

   
case 

 
Discontinued 

 

       
 
 

443  CHIPS, REGULAR, 2.75 oz.,  24 ct/case- 
Code # 120 

   
case 

 
.74 

 
17.76 

       
 
 

444  CHIPS,  BBQ,  2.75oz., 24 ct./case- Code 
#121 

  case  
.74 

 
17.76 

       
 

445  CHIPS, SOUR CREAM & ONION, 
2.75 oz., 24 ct./case – Code #122 

   
case 

 
.74 

 
17.76 

       
 

446  CHIPS,  OLD BAY,  1.5 oz.,  30/case- 
Code #124 

   
case 

 
Discontinued 

 

       
 
 

447  CHIPS, SALT ‘N VINEGAR,  1.5 oz., 
30/case- Code # 123 

   
case 

 
Discontinued 

 

       
 
 

448  CHEESE CURLS,  1.75 oz.,  30/case 
Code # 203 

   
case 

 
Discontinued 

 

       
 
 

449  CHEESE  CURLS,  CRUNCHY,  1 oz., 
48/case- Code #237 

   
case 

 
.24 

 
11.52 

       
 
 

450  POPCORN,  REGULAR 1 ounce, 
42/case- Code #210 

   
case 

 
.24 

 
10.08 

       
 
 
 
    

451  POPCORN,  CHEESE, 1 ounce, 
42/case- Code #220 

   
case 

 
No Bid 

 

      
 

 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 
 
 

Item #  DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT UNIT 
PRICE 

TOTAL 
PRICE 

452  POPCORN,  WHITE CHEDDAR 
.625 ounce, 42/case- Code #271 

   
case 

 
.24 

 
10.08 

       
 

453  POPCORN,  CARMEL,  1.25 ounce, 
60/case 

   
case 

 
No Bid 

 

       
 

454  POPCORN, MICROWAVE, 
10.5 ounce  12/case   Code # 232 

   
case 

 
No Bid 

 

       
 

455  POPCORN, CARMEL,  1.9 ounce, 
48 ct.  Code# 152 

   
case 

 
 .47 

 
22.56 

       
 

456  THINS  PRETZELS,     2.2 5  ounce, 
30/case- Code # 236 

  
case 

 
Discontinued 

 

       
 
 
 
 

457  PRETZEL  STIX,  1 ounce, 60/box/case- 
Code #251  

   
box 

 
Discontinued 

 

       
 
 

458  PRETZEL  STIX,  72/1.25 oz. 
Code #479  Whole Grain Pretzel Stix 

   
box 

 
No Bid 

 

       
 
 

459  CONC.  POTATO  STIX,  1 ounce, 
60/case- Code # 280 

   
case 

 
No Bid 

 

       
 

460  PEANUT BUTTER GRAHAM 
COOKIES,  3/pak/24 pkg/box   

   
box 

 
No Bid 

 

       
 



 
 
 
 

Item #  DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT UNIT 
PRICE 

TOTAL 
PRICE 

461  CHOCOLATE  CRÈME COOKIES 
8/pak/24 pak/box 

   
box 

 
No Bid 

 

       
 
 

462  SLIM JIMS,  TABASCO  SUPER, 
(89 CENTS)  OUNCE, 24 ct. 
Code # 315 

   
 
box 

 
Discontinued 

 

       
 
 

463  FIRECRACKER GIANT,  1 ounce, 
15 CT- Code # 342 

   
box 

 
Discontinued 

 

       
 
 

464  HERR'S HOT FRIES,  3.5 ounce, 20/ct. 
Code # 463 

   
case 

 
.74 

 
14.80 

       
 
   

465  BEEF  JERKY,  24 CT. – Code #314   box .85 26.10 
       

 
 

466  BIG  JERKY,  24 CT.- Code #321   case  
Discontinued 

 

       
 
 

467  CHEYENNE RED HOT SAUSAGE,  
36 ct., Code #588 

  box  
  .30 

 
10.80 

       
 
 

468  SUMMER  SAUSAGE, 15 ct.   case   No Bid  
       

 
 

469  SLIM  JIM,  GIANT,  24 ct. 
Code # 315 

   
box 

 
1.10 

 
26.40 

       
 
 

470  SUPER  JERKY,   24 ct.- Code  #321   case No Bid  
       

 
 

471  PEANUTS,  HONEY  ROASTED, 
1.0 ounce, 24  ct. 

   
box 

 
No Bid 

 

       
 

472  CASHEWS,  1.75 ounce, 12 ct.   box No Bid  
       

 
 



 
 

Item #  DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT UNIT 
PRICE 

TOTAL 
PRICE 

473  RED  PISTACHIOS,  1.75 ounce, 12 CT.   box .74 8.88 
  Code# 673     

 
 

474  CASHEWS,  HONEY  ROASTED,  
1.50 ounce,  12 Ct.,  Code 631 

   
box 

 
 .74 

 
8.88 

       
 
 

475  12- PAK  CHEESE ON CHEESE 
CRACKERS,  11.2 OUNCE, 168/ CASE 
Code # 488 

   
 
case 

 
 
No Bid 

 

       
 
 

476  12-PAK  SOUR CREAM & ONION/  
WHEAT CRACKERS,  11.2 ounce 
168/case-  
CREAM CHEESE WAFER- Code # 521 

   
 
 
case 

 
 
 
No Bid 

 

       
 
 

477  KRAFT CHEESE & CRACKERS 
15 CT.   Code # 501 

   
 

 
No Bid 

 

       
 
 

478  CHEDDAR WHALE CRACKERS,  
1 1/8 OZ 

   
case 

 
No Bid 

 

       
 
 

479  CHEDDAR WHALES  BULK,  7 lb.   case No Bid  
       

 
 

480  CORN CHIPS,  REGULAR, 1.5 ounce, 
42/case- Code # 565  

   
case 

 
No Bid 

 

       
 
 

481  CORN CHIPS,  BBQ,  1. 5 ounce, 
42/case- Code # 566 

   
case 

 
No Bid 

 

       
 
 

482  CORN CHIPS, BBQ, 5ounce, 
20/case- Code # 574 

   
case 

 
No Bid 

 

       
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 
 

Item #  DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT UNIT 
PRICE 

TOTAL 
PRICE 

483  NACHO  TORTILLA CHIPS, 
 72/case- Code # 567 

   
case 

 
.24 

 
17.28 

       
 
 

484  NACHO  TORTILLA CHIPS,   
1.25 ounce,  72/case- Code # 582 

   
case 

 
Discontinued 

 

       
 
 

485  BULK  TORTILLA, 8-6 ounce- 2 lb. 
Code #593 

   
box 

 
3.47 

 
3.47 

       
 
 
 

486  BULK NACHO,  8-6 ounce- 3lb. 
Code # 595 

   
box 

 
Discontinued 

 

       
 
 
 
 

487  BEEF  STICK,  Cheyenne 100 CT.- Code 
#538 

  box .18 18.00 

       
 
 

488  BROWNIE,  20 Ct. per Tray 8 trays/box   box No Bid  
       

 
 

489  HOT FRIES, 48 ct.   box No Bid  
       

 
 

490  CHEDDAR HOT FRIES, 48 ct.   box No Bid  
       

 
 

491  CHOCOLATE  COVERED PRETZELS 
4 ounce 

   
box 

 
No Bid 

 

       
 
 

492  WHITE COVERED PRETZELS   box No Bid  
       

 
 

493  CHOCOLATE  PEANUT  BUTTER   box No Bid  
       

 
 

494  SNACK  MIX, 6 oz. 
15/box  #637 

   
box 

 
.74 

 
11.10 

       
 
 
 



 
 
 
 
 

Item #  DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT UNIT 
PRICE 

TOTAL 
PRICE 

495  BITE SIZE HARD PRETZEL 
1.75 ounce- 84 count #615 

   
box 

 
.24 

 
20.16 

 



 
 
 

Item #  DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT UNIT 
PRICE 

TOTAL 
PRICE 

 
 
 
800 

 OTIS  SPUNKMEYER 
 
 
CHOCOLATE CHIP COOKIE DOUGH 
FROZEN, UNBAKED PRE-PORTIONED 
NUGGETS PER CASE 20LBS. PER 
CASE.  NO ADDITIVES,  
PRESERVATIVES, ANIMAL FATS, 
BULK PACKED, FREEZER TO OVEN 
#1412642 

  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
case 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
No Bid 

 

       
 
 
 

801  CHOCOLATE CHIP WALNUT COOKIE 
DOUGH –FROZEN , UNBAKED, PRE- 
PORTIONED NUGGETS, 240 NUGGETS 
PER CASE,  20 LBS. NO ADDITIVES, 
PRESERVATIVES, ANIMAL FATS, 
BULK PACKED.  FREEZER TO  OVEN 
#1426881 

   
 
 
 
 
 
case 

 
 
 
 
 
 
No Bid 

 

       
 
 

802  CHOCOLATE CHIP PECAN COOKIE 
DOUGH-FROZEN, UNBAKED 
PREPORTIONED NUGGETS, 240 
NUGGETS PER CASE,  20 LBS. PER 
CASE.  NO ADDITIVES ,  
PRESERVATIVES-  ANIMAL FATS, 
BULK PACKED, FREEZER TO OVEN. 
#1598135 

   
 
 
 
 
 
 
case 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
No Bid 

 

       
 
     

803  DOUBLE CHOC.  CHIP COOKIE 
DOUGH FROZEN, UNBAKED PRE- 
PORTIONED NUGGETS, 240 NUGGETS 
PER CASE.  20 LBS./CASE,  NO 
ADDITIVES, PRESERVATIVES,  
ANIMAL FATS, BULK PACKED,  
FREEZER TO OVEN, #1412659 

   
 
 
 
 
 
case 

 
 
 
 
 
 
No Bid 

 

       
 
 
 
 
 



 
 
 
 

Item #  DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT UNIT 
PRICE 

TOTAL 
PRICE 

  

804  OATMEAL RAISIN COOKIE DOUGH 
FROZEN, UNBAKED PREPORTIONED 
NUGGETS.   240 NUGGETS/CASE.  NO 
ADDITIVES, PRESERVATIVES, 
ANIMAL FATS,  BULK PACKED.  
FREEZER TO OVEN   #1412667 

   
 
 
 
 
case 

 
 
 
 
 
No Bid 

 

       
 
 

805  PEANUT BUTTER COOKIE DOUGH 
FROZEN, UNBAKED PREPORTIONED 
NUGGETS, 240 NUGGETS/CASE. 
20 LBS./CASE.  NO  ADDITIVES, 
PRESERVATIVES,  ANIMAL FATS, 
BULK PACKED.  FREEZER TO  OVEN 
#1412683 

   
 
 
 
 
 
case 

 
 
 
 
 
 
No Bid 

 

       
 
 
 

806  BUTTER  SUGAR  COOKIE DOUGH 
FROZEN, UNBAKED  PREPORTIONED 
NUGGETS,  240 NUGGETS/CASE. 
20 LBS./CASE.  NO ADDITIVES, 
PRESERVATIVES,  ANIMAL FATS, 
BULK PACKED, FREEZER TO OVEN 
#1454474 

   
 
 
 
 
 
case 

 
 
 
 
 
 
No Bid 

 

       
 
 

  ALSO  AVAILABLE: 
 
BITE  SIZE  FROZEN  NUGGETS- 410 
PER 20 LB.,  #58 

   
 
 
case 

 
 
 
No Bid 

 

       
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 
 
 


